

**BIDS RECEIVED FOR APRIL 23, 2019 2 PM AT ABERDEEN, SOUTH DAKOTA**  
**FOR ONE (1) REFUSE COLLECTION UNIT-PUBLIC WORKS DEPT**

NAME OF BIDDER - ADDRESS OF BIDDER-	DESCRIPTION	NO BID	\$80,975.00	\$144,000.00	\$83,686.00
NORTHERN TRUCK EQUIP PO BOX 2435 SIOUX FALLS, SD 57101-2435	I STATE TRUCK CENTER 2901 W 60TH STREET N SIOUX FALLS, SD 57107	HARRISON TRUCK CENTERS 1501 N HWY 59 MARSHALL, MN 56258	HARRISON TRUCK CENTERS 1501 N HWY 59 MARSHALL, MN 56258		
<b>ITEM 1</b>	<b>ONE (1) 2019 CAB &amp; CHASSIS</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$80,975.00</b>	<b>\$144,000.00</b>	<b>\$83,686.00</b>
YEAR	2020			2017	2020
MAKE & MODEL	FREIGHTLINER M2 106			WESTERN STAR 4700 SB	FREIGHTLINER M2 106
GVW	38,000			33,000	35,000
DELIVERY DATE	2/1/2020			60-90 DAYS	200 DAY ARO
<b>ITEM 2</b>	<b>ONE (1) REFUSE PACKER BODY</b>	<b>\$62,876.00</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>
FURNISH AND INSTALL REFUSE PACKER BODY					
YEAR MAKE & MODEL	2019 FURY CURBTENDER			2017 QUANTUM CURBTENDER	
MFG.	CURBTENDER			CURBTENDER	
CAPACITY	20 YD.			20 YD.	
<b>TRADE</b>	<b>LESS TRADE ALLOWANCE</b>	<b>\$37,000.00</b>	<b>\$10,000.00</b>	<b>\$30,000.00</b>	<b>\$30,000.00</b>
2012 FREIGHTLINER TRUCK SN: 1FVACYBSODDBW1415 WITH PAC MOR PACKER BODY (20 YD) #525					
<b>NET BID</b>	<b>\$25,876.00</b>	<b>\$70,975.00</b>	<b>\$114,000.00</b>	<b>\$53,686.00</b>	
BID SURETY?	10% BB	10% BB	10% BB	10% BB	10% BB

CERTIFIED BY: 

**BIDS RECEIVED      April 23, 2019      2 PM AT ABERDEEN, SOUTH DAKOTA**  
**FOR      ONE (1) REFUSE COLLECTION UNIT-PUBLIC WORKS DEPT**

**NAME OF BIDDER -**  
**ADDRESS OF BIDDER-**

CRAWFORD TRUCKS & EQUIP

3601 6TH AVE SE

ABERDEEN, SD 57401

OLYMPIC SALES INC.

PO BOX 55

WEST FARGO, ND 58078

DESCRIPTION	ABERDEEN, SD 57401	WEST FARGO, ND 58078
<b>ITEM 1</b>		
<b>ONE (1) 2019 CAB &amp; CHASSIS</b>	<b>\$85,350.00</b>	<b>NO BID</b>
YEAR	2020	
MAKE & MODEL	INTERNATIONAL MV607	
GVW	35,000	
DELIVERY DATE	10/1/2019	
<b>ITEM 2</b>		
<b>ONE (1) REFUSE PACKER BODY</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$57,968.00</b>
FURNISH AND INSTALL REFUSE		
PACKER BODY		
YEAR MAKE & MODEL	2019 NEW WAY VIPER	
MFG.	SCRANTON MFG.	
CAPACITY	20 YD.	
<b>TRADE</b>		
<b>LESS TRADE ALLOWANCE</b>	<b>\$32,000.00</b>	<b>\$32,978.00</b>
2012 FREIGHTLINER TRUCK		
SN: 1FVACYBSODDBW1445 WITH		
PAC MOR PACKER BODY (20 YD) #525		
<b>NET BID</b>	<b>\$53,350.00</b>	<b>\$24,990.00</b>
BID SURETY?	CC - \$ 4,250.00	10% BB

CERTIFIED BY:

